

**City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation**

Opened: September 9, 2022		BuyBoard					
For: SAPD - Annual Contract For 9mm Hornady Ammunition For Police and Other Law Enforcement Officers							
6100015942		AAS					
		Non-Local	Non-Local				
		Non-Local	Non-Local				
		GT Distributors, Inc. 1124 New Meister Lane, Suite 100 Pflugerville TX 78660	GT Distributors, Inc. 1124 New Meister Lane, Suite 100 Pflugerville TX 78660 512-451-8298				
			Proforce Marketing, Inc. 2625 Stearman Rd., Suite A Prescott, AZ 86301				
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity					
1	Hornady 9mm - LE Brass Case, Training 135Gr FMJ Part # 90238 Manufacture Name: Manufacturer Product Number: Vendor Part # Grain weight Rounds Per Case Price Per Case Price Total Lead Time In Days	2575	<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td>Hornady 90238 Hornady-90238 .135 gr 1000 \$394.80 \$1,016,610.00 90-270 Days</td> <td>Hornady 90238 Hornady-90238 .135 gr 1000 \$465.43 \$1,198,482.25 90-270 Days</td> <td> NAS Aguila 1E092110 1E092110 .124 gr 1000 \$226.81 \$584,035.75 60 Days ARO, Up to 300,000 rounds a month </td> </tr> </table>		Hornady 90238 Hornady-90238 .135 gr 1000 \$394.80 \$1,016,610.00 90-270 Days	Hornady 90238 Hornady-90238 .135 gr 1000 \$465.43 \$1,198,482.25 90-270 Days	NAS Aguila 1E092110 1E092110 .124 gr 1000 \$226.81 \$584,035.75 60 Days ARO, Up to 300,000 rounds a month
	Hornady 90238 Hornady-90238 .135 gr 1000 \$394.80 \$1,016,610.00 90-270 Days	Hornady 90238 Hornady-90238 .135 gr 1000 \$465.43 \$1,198,482.25 90-270 Days	NAS Aguila 1E092110 1E092110 .124 gr 1000 \$226.81 \$584,035.75 60 Days ARO, Up to 300,000 rounds a month				
2	Hornady 9mm - Luger-Flex Lock Duty, P135 gr Part # 90225 Manufacture Name: Manufacturer Product Number: Vendor Part # Grain weight Rounds Per Case Price Per Case Price Total Lead Time In Days	596	<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td>Hornady 90225 Hornady-90225 .135 gr 1000 \$530.27 \$316,040.92 90-270 Days</td> <td>Hornady 90225 Hornady-90225 .135 gr 1000 \$625.43 \$372,756.28 90-270 Days</td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>		Hornady 90225 Hornady-90225 .135 gr 1000 \$530.27 \$316,040.92 90-270 Days	Hornady 90225 Hornady-90225 .135 gr 1000 \$625.43 \$372,756.28 90-270 Days	No Bid
	Hornady 90225 Hornady-90225 .135 gr 1000 \$530.27 \$316,040.92 90-270 Days	Hornady 90225 Hornady-90225 .135 gr 1000 \$625.43 \$372,756.28 90-270 Days	No Bid				
3	SUBSTITUTE AMMUNITION FOR ITEM # 1: Hornady 9mm - LE Brass Case, Training 135Gr FM Speer 9mm- Dot G2 Luger 147 gr Part # 54226 Manufacture Name: Vendor Part # Grain weight Rounds Per Case Price Per Case Price Total Lead Time In Days	20	<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td>Speer CCI-54226 .147 gr 1000 \$1,000.57 \$20,011.40 270-540 Days</td> <td>Speer CCI-54226 .147 gr 1000 \$732.82 \$14,656.40 270-540 Days</td> <td>No Bid</td> </tr> </table>		Speer CCI-54226 .147 gr 1000 \$1,000.57 \$20,011.40 270-540 Days	Speer CCI-54226 .147 gr 1000 \$732.82 \$14,656.40 270-540 Days	No Bid
	Speer CCI-54226 .147 gr 1000 \$1,000.57 \$20,011.40 270-540 Days	Speer CCI-54226 .147 gr 1000 \$732.82 \$14,656.40 270-540 Days	No Bid				
	Warranty	Limited 1 Year	NA Limited 1 Year				
	Shelf Life	No response	NA No response				
	Payment Terms	Net 30	Net 30 Net 30				
	Estimated Annual Total		\$1,352,662.32 \$1,585,894.93 \$584,035.75				
	Estimated Annual Award		\$1,332,650.92 \$14,656.40 Incomplete				